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Greetings from Jimbaran 

Exquisite authentic Indonesian cuisines, exotic Balinese décor, efficient and friendly service 
– these phrases pretty much describe Jimbaran, the Sydney-based award-winning 
Indonesian restaurant that has welcome thousands of customers since it first open its doors 
in 2003. 
 
Family-owned, Jimbaran has garnered rave reviews from the Sydney Morning Herald, listed 
on the Sydney’s Good Food Guide and filmed on Food Safari.  
 
Jimbaran’s ala carte and banquet menus cater to diners for different occasions. If you’re 
coming for a corporate function, the modern formal dining room is ideal. But if you’re 
looking for a more laidback dining experience, why not opt for a spot in the covered 
Balinese style courtyard? So whether you’re here for a casual lunch, a business dinner or a 
large family gathering, Jimbaran has the right offerings in the right ambiance just for you.  
 
Satisfy your palate with our wide selection of traditional Indonesian dishes specially 
prepared using the finest, freshest ingredients and aromatic spices. Visit us for an 
unforgettable dining experience. 

Highlights 

Watch a short video by Foxtel Citylife on Jimbaran.  
 
Read reviews by food writers and customers on Jimbaran. 
 
Buy Jimbaran Gift Vouchers for your loved ones. 

 Business Hours: 

Lunch  : (Closed) 
Dinner : Open Daily 6:00 pm to 9:00 pm (Monday Closed) 

FREE HOME DELIVERY (minimum order above $30) within designated area. Below $30 
surcharge applies 

We cater Gluten Free food 

BYO Wine and Beer only, non-smoking 

Courtyard Dining Friday and Saturday 

http://www.youtube.com/watch?v=2HThSupMZNk
http://jimbaran.com.au/index.php/news1/
http://jimbaran.com.au/index.php/news1/
http://jimbaran.com.au/index.php/menu/
http://jimbaran.com.au/index.php/menu/


The Story of Jimbaran 

Those familiar with Bali will recognise the name Jimbaran instantly. The name of a beautiful 
bay in the renowned island, it is synonymous with fabulous seafood, calm waters and 
breathtaking sunsets.  
 
Here at Jimbaran Restaurant in Sydney, we try to recreate the feel of the real Jimbaran by 
providing the finest authentic Indonesian food that is painstakingly prepared in various 
traditional styles of cooking and presented in colourful arrays. The appearance, texture, 
taste and fragrance of the myriad dishes will delight any Indonesian food lover.  
 
Jimbaran is not just about flavours and tastes, though. It is also about experiencing Bali 
without leaving Australian soil. The Balinese artworks proudly displayed, the cosy décor, the 
soothing music and the warmth and friendliness exuded by our staff all bear the hallmarks 
of Indonesian culture and hospitality. 

Our Master Chef 

Is a self-taught chef who concocts her scrumptious dishes using family recipes with a 
modern twist. With the help of her son and a trained chef, she has kept long hours in the 
kitchen to conjure up some of the best Indonesian cuisine, satisfying even the most 
demanding palates. 
 
Don’t just take our word for it. Have a real taste of Jimbaran. Drop by our restaurant for a 
dine-in or have a take-away. It’s a culinary experience you’ll want to enjoy again. 

 


